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Fairfield Christian Academy

Friday, September 27, 2019

Events
Upcoming

VS

TOMORROW
7:00 p.m.

No School
10/9/19 - 10/11/19

American
Red Cross

Blood Drive
10/4/18

8:00 am - 1:00 pm

Are you looking for your child’s student number to use 
E-Funds or Chalkable Cafe? You may log into InfoNow and 
click on Demographics on the left. Your child’s student 
number will be found in the Personal Information box. 

Chalkable/InfoNOW

Noon - 3:00

YARD SALE
SENIOR 

Friday, 10/19 
10:00 - 5:00

Saturday, 10/20
8:00 - 3:00

Save money by ordering your 2019-2020 yearbook in 
September! Log on to treering.com to save 15% off all FCA 
yearbook orders by Mon. Sept. 30th.
    K-5th -$15.00 FCA code: 101346967434163
    6th-8th - $13.00 FCA code: 1014389944351442
    9th-12th - $30.00 FCA code: 1014389969904656
Questions? Email Mrs. Wise at lwise@fcaknights.us.

Ordering Yearbooks

September 28
Homecoming Game
October 4
Red Cross
Blood Drive
October 9-11
No School
October 16
Grade 10-11 PSAT 
October 18-19
Senior Class
Yard Sale
October 25
K-12 Jean Day
7-12 Pizza Day
November 1
National Honor 
Society Assembly
November 14
Parent Teacher 
Conferences
November 14
Educational Apparel
Uniform Sale
November 15
K-12 Jean Day
7-12 Pizza Day
November 21
Parent Teacher
Conferences

HOMECOMING GAME
SATURDAY, SEPT. 28th

FESTIVITIES BEGIN AT 6:00. KICK-OFF AT 7:00.

After school spirit wear sales are back!  Stop by the Athletic 
Boosters table after school on the first and third Fridays of 
the month. Shop in stock items or order custom spirit wear. 
Join the FCAAB today! Your membership counts! 

Spirit Wear Sales

If your child needs to be released early from school, please 
send a note indicating time of release and reason for the 
absence.  Secondary students will be dismissed to Door B at 
the time indicated. For elementary students, the attendance 
office will provide a pass for you to get your child from the 
classroom.

Early Release Procedure

FCA’s Swim Team
Coach Erin Barnhart is excited to see the number of 
students interested in the Knight’s Swim Team. It is a great 
opportunity for our students. He also has some exciting 
news with our team in the coming weeks! If you were not 
able to attend the meeting and have not yet turned in your 
information form, please turn it in to Mr. Hildenbrand by 
October 4th.


